

			Commercial Office Environments			Business Environments			Hudson Office Solutions			ID&A			Corporate Design		
TAG	Description	Quantity	Unit Price	Total Price	Lead Times	Unit Price	Total Price	Lead Times	Unit Price	Total Price	Lead Times	Unit Price	Total Price	Lead Times	Unit Price	Total Price	Lead Times
BC1	METAL BOOKCASE	8				397.25	3,178.00	3-4 weeks	325.00	2,600.00	3-4 weeks				522.26	4,178.08	
C1	ALL POLY STACK CHA	277	106.25	29,431.25	4-5 weeks	99.05	27,436.85	4-5 weeks	97.85	27,104.45	4-5 weeks	102.29	28,334.33	6-8 weeks	107.35	29,735.95	4-6 weeks
C2	ALL PLY STACK CHAIR	18	214.25	3,856.50	4-5 weeks	204.71	3,684.78	4-5 weeks	202.25	3,640.50	4-5 weeks	206.81	3,722.58	6-8 weeks	221.86	3,993.48	4-6 weeks
C3	LOUNGE CHAIR	5	No Bid			1,387.08	6,935.40	6-8 weeks	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
C3 ALTERNATE						1,304.90	6,522.00	3-4 weeks									
C4	LOUNGE CHAIR	5	No Bid			1,387.08	6,935.40	6-8 weeks	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
C4 ALTERNATE						1,304.40	6,522.00	3-4 weeks									
C5	TASK CHAIR	121	No Bid			228.00	27,588.00	4-5 weeks				No Bid			No Bid		
C5 ALTERNATE						No Bid			253.00	30,613.00	3 weeks				212.98	25,770.58	4-6 weeks
C6	TASK CHAIR	1	No Bid			416.00	416.00	3-4 weeks	379.00	379.00	3-4 weeks	No Bid			568.64	568.64	4-6 weeks
DK1	DESK	1	No Bid			505.60	505.60	3-4 weeks	No Bid			No Bid			632.65	632.65	4-6 weeks
DK2	DESK	2	No Bid			573.44	1,146.88	3-4 weeks	No Bid			No Bid			735.75	1,471.50	4-6 weeks
DK3	DESK	1	No Bid			1,541.33	1,541.33	3-4 weeks	No Bid			No Bid			1,594.96	1,594.96	4-6 weeks
P1A	PANELS	1	No Bid			5,127.02	5,127.02	3-4 weeks	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
P1B	MOVABLE WALLS	1				No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
P1B ALTERNATE	MOVABLE WALLS	1				11,260.00	11,260.00	6 weeks after approval of shop drawings									
P1B ALTERNATE	Floor to Ceiling Panel Walls	1				6,682.10	6,682.10	3-4 weeks									
P1B ALTERNATE	Floor to Ceiling Panel Walls	1				8,062.15	8,062.15	3-4 weeks									
STG1	STORAGE	3	No Bid			379.24	1,137.72	3-4 weeks	385.00	1,155.00	3-4 weeks	No Bid			448.84	1,346.52	
T1	TABLE	4	No Bid			418.32	1,673.28	6-7 weeks	375.00	1,500.00	6-7 weeks	No Bid			No Bid		
T1 ALTERNATE						No Bid											
T2	CONFERENCE TABLE	1	No Bid			1,578.36	1,578.36	6-7 weeks	1,250.00	1,250.00	3-4 weeks	No Bid			No Bid		
T2 ALTERNATE						No Bid											
T3	TRAINING TABLE	137	392.20	53,731.40	4-5 weeks	359.22	49,213.14	4-5 weeks	374.95	51,368.15	3-4 weeks	376.86	51,629.82	6-8 weeks	389.33	53,338.21	
T4	TRAINING TABLE	0	561.85	561.85	4-5 weeks	525.18	525.18	4-5 weeks	549.00	549.00	4-5 weeks	541.05	541.05	6-8 weeks	569.19	569.19	
T5	TRAINING TABLE	0	407.05	814.10	4-5 weeks	373.75	747.50	4-5 weeks	389.00	778.00	4-5 weeks	391.24	782.48	6-8 weeks	405.06	810.12	
T6	TRAINING TABLE	0	356.65	713.30	4-5 weeks	324.45	648.90	4-5 weeks	339.00	678.00	4-5 weeks	342.47	684.94	6-8 weeks	351.63	703.26	
T7	TRAINING TABLE	3	367.45	1,102.35	4-5 weeks	335.01	1,005.03	4-5 weeks	349.00	1,047.00	4-5 weeks	352.92	1,058.76	6-8 weeks	363.08	1,089.24	
T8	TRAINING TABLE	28				303.76	8,505.28	4-5 weeks									
WS1	COMMON TOP	1	No Bid			241.28	241.28	3-4 weeks	No Bid			No Bid			360.07	360.07	
Addendum #1		79	36.00	1,980.00	4-5 weeks	35.22	2,782.38	3-4 weeks	37.00	2,035.00	4-5 weeks	34.84	1,916.20	6-8 weeks	38.17	2,099.35	

92,190.75

191,601.56

124,697.10

88,670.16

128,261.80

\* ALTERNATES ARE ACCEPTABLE ON C3, C4, C5, P1B, T1, T2.