

UNIVERSITY OF SOUTHERN INDIANA				D	E	F	G	H
University of Southern Indiana Orr Center Registrar Renovation Furnishings Package Spreadsheet Project Number: 1703109				DEALER NAME: CONTACT PERSON: PHONE: EMAIL:	(COMPANY NAME) (YOUR NAME HERE) (000-000-0000) (EMAIL HERE)	Business Environments	Hudson	Commercial Office Environments
TAG	Description	Manufacturer	Product Name/Style	Quantity	Total Price (with installation)	Total Price (with Installation)	Total Price (with Installation)	
3	C1.1 Lounge Chair with Arms	Loewenstein	Dess Lounge Chair	2	\$3,054.66	No Bid	\$3,377.46	
4	C1.1A				\$2,046.10	\$2,540.00		
5	C2.1 Side Chair/ No Arms	Sit On It	Lumin 4-Leg Guest Chair	6	\$1,089.60	\$1,074.00	\$1,244.82	
6	C2.1A							
7	C3.1 Swivel Chair	Source International	I-Swivel Conf Chair	14	\$5,894.56	\$5,936.00	\$6,077.68	
8	C3.1A							
9	C4.1 Guest Chair w/Arms	Sit On It	Freelance Multipurpose Chair	19	\$4,802.63	\$4,066.00	\$5,760.77	
10	C4.1A							
11	T1.1 Rectangular Conference Table	Kimball	Dock Conference Table	1	\$4,517.55	\$4,581.51	No Bid	
12	T1.1A							
13	T2.1 Rectangular Table	Kimball	Break Room Dock Table	1	\$1,047.14	\$663.78	No Bid	
14	T2.1A				\$466.58			
15	T3.1 Rectangular Table	Kimball	Footprint/ Priority/ Perks Computer Table	1	\$978.14	\$1,136.05	No Bid	
16	T3.1A							
17	T4.1 Rectangular Table	Kimball	Footprint/ Priority/ Perks Computer Table	2	\$1,386.92	\$1,840.94	No Bid	
18	T4.1A							
19	D1.1 U Shape Desk	Kimball	Footprint Freestanding Desk	1	\$3,027.73	\$3,506.47	No Bid	
20	D1.1A							
21	D2.1 U Shape Desk	Kimball	Footprint Freestanding Desk	1	\$3,088.14	\$3,639.38	No Bid	
22	D2.1A							
23	D3.1 U Shape Desk	Kimball	Footprint Freestanding Desk	1	\$2,911.13	\$3,424.40	No Bid	
24	D3.1A							
25	D4.1 U Shape Desk	Kimball	Footprint Freestanding Desk	1	\$2,917.03	\$3,480.43	No Bid	
26	D4.1A							
27	D5.1 U Shape Desk	Kimball	Footprint Freestanding Desk	1	\$3,001.99	\$3,567.54	No Bid	
28	D5.1A							
29	D6.1 U Shape Desk	Kimball	Footprint Freestanding Desk	2	\$6,100.74	\$7,189.02	No Bid	
30	D6.1A							
31	D8.1 U Shape Desk	Kimball	Priority Desk	1	\$5,283.11	\$5,400.39	No Bid	
32	D7.1A							
33	STG1.1 Storage	Kimball	Fundamental/ Footprint	2	\$480.99	\$697.60	No Bid	
34	STG1.1A							
35	STG2.1 Bookcase	Kimball	Priority- 5H Bookcase	1	\$376.35	\$434.26	No Bid	
36								

Procurement Services

	*A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
		UNIVERSITY OF SOUTHERN INDIANA				\$2,137.84	\$2,994.51	No Bid
37	STG3.1	Storage	Kimball	Fundamental/ Universal	1			
38	STG3.1A							
						\$3,050.44	\$1,791.78	No Bid
39	STG4.1	Storage	Kimball	Fundamental/ Footprint	2			
40	STG4.1A							
						\$1,609.05	\$1,884.10	No Bid
41	STG5.1	Storage	Kimball	Fundamental/ Footprint	1			
42	STG5.1A							
						\$516.77	\$534.37	No Bid
43	WKSF1.1	Rectangular Worksurface	Kimball	Footprint Surface	1			
44	WKSF1.1A					\$311.15		
						\$716.00	\$624.00	\$573.76
45	AC1.1	Coat Rack	Peter Pepper	Model 2141 Coat Rack (1 per office)	8			
46	AC1.1A							
						\$238.51	\$279.00	\$298.35
47	MB1.1	Wall Mounted Marker Board	Claridge	800 Series Marker Board	1			
48	MB1.1A							
						\$208.89	\$249.00	\$267.67
49	TB1.1	Wall Mounted Tack Board	Claridge	800 Series Tack Board	1			
50	TB1.1A							
						\$27,662.25	\$33,772.46	No Bid
51	WS1.1	Open Office Work Stations	Kimball/ Steelcase	Xite/Footprint	1			
52	WS1.1A							
						\$3,114.06	\$3,734.47	No Bid
53	WS2.1	U Shape Work Station	Kimball/Steelcase	Xite/Footprint	1			
54	WS2.1A							
						\$3,048.80	\$3,573.42	No Bid
55	WS3.1	L Shape Reception Desk	Kimball/Steelcase	Xite/Footprint	1			
56	WS3.1A							
57						\$92,271.02	\$102,614.88	\$17,600.51
58								

Procurement Services