

USI SCREAMING EAGLE ARENA ADDITION FFE

30-Oct-18

New Furniture Bid Tabulation

ITEM	QTY	COMMERCIAL OFFICE ENVIRONMENTS UNIT PRICE WITH INSTALLATION	COE QTY	COMMERCIAL OFFICE ENVIRONMENTS EXTENDED PRICE WITH INSTALLATION	NOTES	BUSINESS ENVIRONMENTS UNIT PRICE WITH INSTALLATION	BE QTY	BUSINESS ENVIRONMENTS EXTENDED PRICE WITH INSTALLATION	NOTES	CORPORATE DESIGN UNIT PRICE WITH INSTALLATION	CD QTY	CORPORATE DESIGN EXTENDED PRICE WITH INSTALLATION	NOTES	HUDSON OFFICE SOLUTIONS UNIT PRICE WITH INSTALLATION	HSO QTY	HUDSON OFFICE SOLUTIONS EXTENDED PRICE WITH INSTALLATION	NOTES	LEGEND
A-1 TRASH/RECYCLING	18	\$2671.35 INCLUDED	18	\$48,084.30	A-1	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		CORRECT QUANTITY (BIDDERS QUANTITY)
A-2 CHAIR DOLLY	10	\$136.02 INCLUDED	10 (11)	\$1,360.20	A-2 Extended price revised to denote correct quantity. QTY in parenthesis is original bid QTY. A-2 corresponds to CH-3, BE was lowest overall for A-2/CH-3	\$154.48 INCLUDED	10 (28)	\$1,544.80	A-2 Extended price revised to denote correct quantity. QTY in parenthesis is original bid QTY. A-2 corresponds to CH-3, BE was lowest overall for A-2/CH-3	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		LOW BIDDER
A-3 NOT USED																		ITEMS THAT RECEIVED NO BID / NOT PURCHASED
A-4 TRASH/RECYCLING	3	\$1977.81 INCLUDED	3	\$5,933.43	A-3	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		
A-5 WASTE RECEPTACLE	7	\$27.42 INCLUDED	7 (1)	\$184.94	A-5 Extended price revised to denote correct quantity. QTY in parenthesis is original bid QTY. Item not awarded to any vendor per USI request.	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		
A-6 CUBE TRUCK	6	\$460.12 INCLUDED	6	\$2,760.72	A-6	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		
A-7 STLCS THREAD	3	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		
A-8 FOLDING CHAIR CART	2	\$864.70 INCLUDED	2 (3)	\$1,729.40	A-5 Extended price revised to denote correct quantity. QTY in parenthesis is original bid QTY	\$819.43 INCLUDED	2	\$1,638.86	A-8	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		
B-1 BENCH	11	\$675.19 INCLUDED	11	\$7,427.09	B-1	\$664.00 INCLUDED	11	\$7,304.00	B-1	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		
CH-1A/B TASK CHAIR	11	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$366 INCLUDED	11	\$4,026.00	CH-1A	\$584.20 INCLUDED	11 (1)	\$6,426.20	CH-1B Extended price revised to denote correct quantity. QTY in parenthesis is original bid qty	\$422.63 INCLUDED	11	\$4,648.93	CH-1A	
CH-2 UPH. FOLDING CHAIR	48	\$144.31 INCLUDED	48	\$6,926.88	CH-2	\$132.18 INCLUDED	48	\$6,344.64	CH-2	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		
CH-3 FOLDING CHAIR	700	\$29.72 INCLUDED	700	\$20,804.00	CH-3	\$28.83 INCLUDED	700	\$20,181.00	CH-3	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		
CH-4 DINING STACK CHAIR	12	\$203.35 INCLUDED	12	\$2,440.32	CH-4	\$198.97 INCLUDED	12	\$2,387.64	CH-4	NO BID		NO BID		\$178.00 INCLUDED	12	\$2,136.00	CH-4	
CH-5 BARSTOOL	6	\$264.65 INCLUDED	6	\$1,587.90	CH-5	\$263.40 INCLUDED	6	\$1,580.40	CH-5	NO BID		NO BID		\$231 INCLUDED	6	\$1,386.00	CH-5	
CH-6 BARSTOOL	24	NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID	0	NO BID		\$413.75 INCLUDED	24 (1)	\$9,930.00	CH-6 Extended price revised to denote correct quantity. QTY in parenthesis is original bid QTY	NO BID		NO BID		
CH-7 DINING CHAIR	32	NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID	0	NO BID		\$307.57 INCLUDED	32 (1)	\$9,842.24	CH-7 Extended price revised to denote correct quantity. QTY in parenthesis is original bid QTY	NO BID		NO BID		
CH-8 NESTING CHAIR	24	NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		
CH-9 SIDE CHAIR	1	\$208.67 INCLUDED	1	\$208.67	CH-9	\$197.25 INCLUDED	1	\$197.25	CH-9	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$182.00 INCLUDED	1	\$182.00	CH-9	
CH-10 MEDICAL STAIR CHAIR	1	NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID	0	NO BID		
CH-11 FOLDING CHAIR W/ LOGO	60	\$141.62 INCLUDED	60	\$8,497.20	CH-11	\$129.57 INCLUDED	60	\$7,774.20	CH-11	NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		CH-11
CH-12 STACK CHAIR	12	\$203.35 INCLUDED	12	\$2,440.20	CH-12	\$198.97 INCLUDED	12	\$2,387.64	CH-12	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$178.00 INCLUDED	12	\$2,136.00	CH-12	
CH-13 BARSTOOL	8	\$264.65 INCLUDED	8	\$2,117.20	CH-13	\$263.40 INCLUDED	8	\$2,107.20	CH-13	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$231.00 INCLUDED	8	\$1,848.00	CH-13	
CH-14 STACK CHAIR	24	\$114.69 INCLUDED	24	\$2,752.56	CH-14	\$114.25 INCLUDED	24	\$2,742.00	CH-14	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$98.00 INCLUDED	24	\$2,352.00	CH-14	
CH-15 BARSTOOL	16	\$175.98 INCLUDED	16	\$2,815.68	CH-15	\$178.68 INCLUDED	16	\$2,858.88	CH-15	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$153.00 INCLUDED	16	\$2,448.00	CH-15	

USI SCREAMING EAGLE ARENA ADDITION FFE
30-Oct-18
New Furniture Bid Tabulation

ITEM	QTY	COMMERCIAL OFFICE ENVIRONMENTS UNIT PRICE WITH INSTALLATION	COE QTY	COMMERCIAL OFFICE ENVIRONMENTS EXTENDED PRICE WITH INSTALLATION	NOTES	BUSINESS ENVIRONMENTS UNIT PRICE WITH INSTALLATION	BE QTY	BUSINESS ENVIRONMENTS EXTENDED PRICE WITH INSTALLATION	NOTES	CORPORATE DESIGN UNIT PRICE WITH INSTALLATION	CD QTY	CORPORATE DESIGN EXTENDED PRICE WITH INSTALLATION	NOTES	HUDSON OFFICE SOLUTIONS UNIT PRICE WITH INSTALLATION	HSO QTY	HUDSON OFFICE SOLUTIONS EXTENDED PRICE WITH INSTALLATION	NOTES	LEGEND
LS-1A/B SECTIONAL LOUNGE	22	1092.43 INCLUDED	22 (16)	\$24,033.46	LS-1A Extended price revised to denote correct quantity. Qty in parenthesis is original bid qty.	\$855.26 INCLUDED	22	\$18,815.72	LS-1B	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$755.39 INCLUDED	22	\$16,618.58	LS-1A	
LS-2A/B SECTIONAL LOUNGE	4	\$1247.72 INCLUDED	4	\$4,990.88	LS-2A	\$1271.65 INCLUDED	4	\$5,086.60	LS-2B	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$1200.17 INCLUDED	4 (3)	\$4,800.68	LS-2A	LS-2A Extended price revised to denote correct quantity. Qty in parenthesis is original bid qty.
LS-3 LOUNGE CHAIR	4	NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID	0	NO BID		\$1399.42 INCLUDED	4 (1)	\$5,597.68	LS-3	NO BID	0	NO BID	LS-3	LS-3 Extended price revised to denote correct quantity. Qty in parenthesis is original bid qty.
LS-4A/B SECTIONAL LOUNGE	11	\$801.45 INCLUDED	11	\$8,815.95	LS-4A	\$855.26 INCLUDED	11	\$9,407.86	LS-4B	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$754.48 INCLUDED	11	\$8,299.28	LS-4A	
LS-5A/B SECTIONAL LOUNGE	2	\$1254.46 INCLUDED	2	\$2,508.92	LS-5A	\$1271.65 INCLUDED	2	\$2,543.30	LS-5B	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$1207.17 INCLUDED	2 (3)	\$2,414.34	LS-5A	LS-5A Extended price revised to denote correct quantity. Qty in parenthesis is original bid qty.
LS-6 SOFA	1	NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID	0	NO BID		\$2404.49 INCLUDED	1	\$2,404.49	LS-6	NO BID	0	NO BID	LS-6	
OT-1A/B OCCASIONAL TABLE	6	\$2734.77 INCLUDED	6	\$16,408.62	OT-1A	\$3552.92 INCLUDED	6	\$21,335.52	OT-1A	NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID	0	NO BID		
OT-2 OCCASIONAL TABLE	1	\$1045.81 INCLUDED	1	\$1,045.81	OT-2	\$1097.10 INCLUDED	1	\$1,097.10	OT-2	\$1076.96 INCLUDED	1	\$1,076.96	OT-2	NO BID	0	NO BID		
OT-3 OCCASIONAL TABLE	2	\$900.86 INCLUDED	2	\$1,801.72	OT-3	\$942.08 INCLUDED	2	\$1,884.16	OT-3	\$930.43 INCLUDED	2 (1)	\$1,860.86	OT-3	NO BID	0	NO BID	OT-3	OT-3 Extended price revised to denote correct quantity. Qty in parenthesis is original bid qty.
ST-1A/B STORAGE CAB	3	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$685.70 INCLUDED	3	\$2,057.10	ST-1A	\$836.41 INCLUDED	3 (1)	\$2,509.23	ST-1B	\$695.51 INCLUDED	3	\$2,086.53	ST-1A	ST-1A, ST2, ST3 & ST6 awarded as combined total package: BE= \$5,452.35, CDI = \$5,650.96
ST-2A/B 2 DWR LAT FILE CAB	1	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$501.70 INCLUDED	1	\$501.70	ST-2A	\$326.41 INCLUDED	1	\$326.41	ST-2B	\$422.62 INCLUDED	1	\$422.62	ST-2A	ST-1, ST2, ST3 & ST6 awarded as combined total package: BE= \$5,452.35, CDI = \$5,650.96
ST-3A/B BOX/BOX/FILE PED	5	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$320.79 INCLUDED	5	\$1,603.95	ST-3A	\$252.26 INCLUDED	5 (1)	\$1,261.30	ST-3B	\$375.22 INCLUDED	5 (4)	\$1,876.10	ST-3A	ST-1, ST2, ST3 & ST6 awarded as combined total package: BE= \$5,452.35, CDI = \$5,650.96
ST-4 MOBILE WORKBENCH	1	\$2463.85 INCLUDED	1	\$2,463.85	ST-4	\$3453.25 INCLUDED	1	\$3,453.25	ST-4	NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID	0	NO BID		
ST-5A/B/C/D SHELVING UNIT	28	\$276.89 INCLUDED	0	\$7,752.92	ST-5B	\$352.58 INCLUDED	28	\$9,872.24	ST-5A	NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID	0	NO BID		
ST-6 STORAGE CABINET	2	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$644.80 INCLUDED	2	\$1,289.60	ST-6A	\$772.01 INCLUDED	2 (1)	\$1,554.02	ST-6B	\$665.73 INCLUDED	2	\$1,331.46	ST-6A	ST-1, ST2, ST3 & ST6 awarded as combined total package: BE= \$5,452.35, CDI = \$5,650.96
T-1A/B/C BAR HEIGHT TABLE	15	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$449.60 INCLUDED	15	\$6,744.00	T-1A	\$367.67 INCLUDED	15 (1)	\$5,515.05	T-1C	\$469.98 INCLUDED	15	\$7,049.70	T-1A	T-1C Extended price revised to denote correct quantity. Qty in parenthesis is original bid qty.
T-2/B/C DINING TABLE	6	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$414.40 INCLUDED	6	\$2,486.40	T-2A	\$231.25 INCLUDED	6 (1)	\$1,387.50	T-2C	\$433.19 INCLUDED	15	\$6,497.85	T-2A	T-2C Extended price revised to denote correct quantity. Qty in parenthesis is original bid qty.
T-3 FOLDING TABLE	6	NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID	0	NO BID		NO BID	0	NO BID		
T-4 DINING TABLE	8	NO BID	0	NO BID		\$414.40 INCLUDED	8	\$3,315.20	T-2A	\$338.04 INCLUDED	8 (1)	\$2,704.32	T-4C	\$653.02 INCLUDED	8	\$5,224.16	T-4A	T-4C Extended price revised to denote correct quantity. Qty in parenthesis is original bid qty.
TOTAL				\$187,707.88				\$154,568.21				\$52,396.26				\$73,758.23		